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UPDATED 08-03-23
# Item Description/Specifications UOM Winning Vendor Bid Price Unit of Measure Brand Order #

1 Toilet Paper  1 Ply 4"x4.5" x 1500' roll - 1.75" core - 
48rolls/case

1500 foot roll - 48 
rolls per case WB MAson $51.20 48/carton Alliance ALIC405201 

Updated 
08-03-23

3 Toilet Tissue 
MorCon MorSoft Millennium 2 ply Toilet Tissue 
750 sheets 48/case
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

750 sheets per roll - 
48 rolls per case Conlon $53.00 case Morcon M600

4 Toilet Tissue Jumbo Roll - 1 ply - 3.5 x 2000 ft. - 12 rolls/case 2000 foot roll - 12 
rolls per case WB Mason $31.94 12/CT Alliance ALIC420001 

5 Toilet Tissue  Green Heritage  Bathroom Tissue, Economy, 2-
Ply, 500 Sheets/Roll, 96/Case 96 rolls/case Mansfield $41.63 96 Resolute 376GH

6 Bath Tissue Cascade - CSD T150 2 Ply - 950 sheets/roll
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] 36 rolls/case WB Mason $56.89 36/CT Cascade CSDT150

7 Urinal Screens & Blocks SSS Triples 12/case 12 per case Pyramid $15.98 CS/12 IMPACT 9480S

8 Urinal Pads - Scented Urinal Pads - Scented 12 per case WB Mason $12.25 12/CT Boardwalk BWK1001

9 Toilet Bowl Cleaner Freedom II Bowl Cleaner Non Acid 12/32 oz. 32 oz - 12 per case Nextgen $20.70 12/32oz Simonize SIMF1235012

10 Toilet Bowl Swab with Squeegee 
Tube

Toilet Bowl Swab with Squeegee Tube - Impact 
3600 - each Each WB Mason $1.07 EA Boardwalk BWK00160EA

11 Wax Bags - Sanitary Napkins 9 x 10.5 inch - specify number per box 250/box Staples $23.50 case/500 HOSPECO 239835

13 Floor Stripper- non rise Buckeye Ripsaw Floor Stripper - 5 Gallon Box 5 gallon box Mansfield $42.46 5gal Simoniz RELEASE

15 Floor Stripper Simonize Release - 5 Gallon Pail
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] 5 Gallon Pail Conlon $32.94 pail Simoniz R3025005

16 Floor Stripper 
Flash 55 Floor Stripper - Pioneer - AMD516FS - 5 
Gallon
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

5 Gallon Pail WB Mason $95.30 (2) 2.5GL/CS Pioneer Eclipse AMN516FS

17 Stripping Pad 19" Stripping Pad - 5/box 5/box Pyramid $12.35 BX/5 ACS 72-19

18 Stripping Pad 3M 7300 29' BLACK -HIGH PRODUCTIVITY Each Pyramid $16.99 BX/5 ACS 73-20 
** IEM IS 20" **

19 Stripping Pad 20"Americo - 5/box
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] 5/box WB Mason $12.44 5/CT Americo ACS7220 

20 Stripping Pad 20" 3M 7200 - 5/case
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] 5 per case WB Mason $12.25 5/CT 3M WBM720020WB

21 Floor Finisher
Omni Guard Floor Finish - Pioneer - AMN141FS - 
2.5 Gallon / 2 per case
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

2 - 2.5 gal/Case Nextgen $93.35 5 gallon Pioneer Eclipse CBP712

22 Floor Cleaner BETCO - Best Scrub - BCC6700500 - 5 Gallon
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] 5 Gallon Pail WB Mason $55.20 5 Gallon Pail Betco BCC6700500

23 Floor Cleaner BETCO - Fastdraw 1 PH7 Ultra - 17847-00 - 
Box of (4) 2 Liter Containers

4 - 2 Liter 
Containers per 
case

WB Mason $109.92 4/CT Betco BCC1784700
Updated 
08-03-23

26 Floor Wax  25% Solid Castleguard Metal Cross Linked Floor Finish - 5-
gallon box 5 Gallon Box Staples $80.88 EACH Midlab, Inc. 815030

Updated 
08-03-23

27 Floor Wax 
Wet Look Floor Wax Plus - Simonize - CSO750 - 
5 gallon
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

5 Gallon Pail Conlon $61.94 pail Simoniz CS0750005

28 Wax Sta-Brite Square Pail - 5 gallon pail 5 Gallon Pail C&C $70.41 EACH SIMONIZ CS0740 10126333PAIL

Will have 
to pay 

shipping 
charges 

with C&C

No other 
Vendors 

Bid

Updated 
08-03-23

29 Gym Finish
Super Court HD Gym Finish - BONO - 
BNWWT7620-55008 - 5 Gallon
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

5 Gallon Pail Conlon $358.00 pail Bona 32001
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Item #29 Alternative Brand C&C $55.81 EACH SPARTAN 5822 29001384PAIL

Will have 
to pay 

shipping 
charges 

with C&C

Updated 
08-03-23

31 Carpet Stain Remover NEXGEN Spottless Q  Oxygenated carpet stain 
remover  QSP045 12 per case Staples $144.00 Case/12 Betco 24531047

Updated 
08-03-23

31 Carpet Stain Remover NEXGEN Spottless Q  Oxygenated carpet stain 
remover  QSP045 12 per case C&C $42.78 CASE SIMONIZ G1403 10110674CASE

Will have 
to pay 

shipping 
charges 

with C&C

Updated 
08-03-23

32 Buff spray NextGen turn Around buff spray SSS4816 12 per case C&C $47.60 CASE SPARTAN 4440 29000755CASE
Updated 
08-03-23

33 Carpet Shampoo NextGen FiberMaster carpet shampoo FIBEXT1 4 per case C&C $28.94 CASE SIMONIZ C0520 10124408CASE

Will have 
to pay 

shipping 
charges 

with C&C

Updated 
08-03-23

33 Carpet Shampoo NextGen FiberMaster carpet shampoo FIBEXT1 4 per case Nextgen $45.40 4 gall/case MD Stetson SuperUnqt
Updated 
08-03-23

34 Carpet Shampoo Steam Plus Carpet Shampoo - 4 gallons/case 4 gallons/case WB Mason $36.05 4/CT NCL NCL66029
Updated 
08-03-23

34 Carpet Shampoo Steam Plus Carpet Shampoo - 4 gallons/case 4 gallons/case C&C $28.94 CASE SIMONIZ C0520 10124408CASE

Will have 
to pay 

shipping 
charges 

with C&C

Updated 
08-03-23

35 Carpet Shampoo
Automatic Shampoo - SSS - 48007 - 4 
Gallons/Case
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

4 Gallons per case Conlon $72.00 case SSS 48007

36 Carpet Shampoo BETCO FAST DRAW 15  - 2L
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item #36 Alternative Brand C&C $72.99 CASE
Scotchgard™ 

Extraction 
Cleaner 3M 85928 #27A

37  Hand Sanitizer  1000 ml - 6/case - includes dispenser at no 
charge 6 per case Conlon $61.30 case Kutol 68841

39 Foaming Hand Soap Kutol - Kut686L05 - 6/case
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] 6 per case Conlon $38.00 case Kutol 68641

40 Foaming Hand Soap 1000ML - Kutol - KUT69041 - specify units/case
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] Each Conlon $6.18 EACH Kutol 69041

44 Hand Sanitizer KUT68841 - Kutol Foaming Hand sanitizer
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] 6 per case Conlon $61.30 case Kutol 68841

45 Dispenser Kutol Dispensers   EZ Foam Manual 
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] Each Conlon $1.00 each Kutol SS001BK31
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46 Disinfectant Betco Fastdraw 2 AF79 - Con - #33147-00 - 
4-2 Liter Bottles per case

4 - 2 Liter 
Containers per 
case

WB Mason $99.20 4/CT Betco BCC3314700

47 Lysol Spray Disinfectant 19 oz. - 12/case 12 per case Conlon $31.85 CASE Chase 433-4104

48 Pine Sol 
144 oz. Lemon or Orange Cleaner specify units 
per case
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

3 per case Quill $32.76 Pine-Sol 776978

49 Pine Sol 144 oz Lavendor
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] 3 per case Conlon $34.78 case PineSol 97301

50 Bleach  Gallon - specify units/case and Brand Bid Each Conlon $17.24 case KIK BLEACH101

53 Glass Cleaner 19 oz. aerosol can 19oz can - Each Staples $14.66 case of 6
CLAIRE 

MANUFACTURIN
G

2611662

55 Glass Cleaner
#19947-00 BETCO CLEAR IMAGE FAST DRAW 
GLASS CLEANER - 2L
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

BOX/4 Staples $99.99 4 BETCO CORP 2773500

56 Glass Cleaner
SSS Glass Cleaner Spray - 19oz - 12/case - 
#21002
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

12 per case Conlon $42.00 CASE SSS 21002

58 Cleaner
Super Court Cleaner - BONO - BNAM70001818 - 
1 Gallon
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

1 Gallon Each Conlon $64.00 GALLON BONA WM700018184

59 Cleaner
Pretreat Concentrated Extract - SSS - 48070 - 4 
Gallon/case
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

4 Gallons per case Conlon $66.00 CASE SSS 48070

61 Cleaner

Betco Fastdraw SPECTACULOSO - 2L
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]
[Vendor please indicate # of bottles if sold per 
case]

2 Liter Each Staples $63.99 4 BETCO CORP 24477091

62 Cleaner
Betco Best Scent - Ocean Breeze - 
#BCC2314700
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

4 per case Staples $181.00 4 BETCO CORP 2773498

63 Cleaner
Betco Green Earth Peroxide Cleaner - 
#BCC3364700
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

4 per case Conlon $107.00 CASE Betco 3364700

64 Cleaner
SHA-ZYME Deororizer - Restroom Cleaner - 
Gallon - No-Rinse - #1831
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

4 per case WB Mason $57.61 4/CT NCL NCL183129 

65 Cleaner
 Sha-Zyme - Heavy Duty Cleaner - Gallon -  
#NCL508124 
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

4 per case WB Mason $54.63 4/CT NCL NCL183029 

67 Cleaner

NCL Sha-Zyme Grease Attack / Anti Slip / 
Deodorize Bio-Cleaner - 1 Galon - 4/Case - 
#NCL183029
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

1 Gallon - 4 per 
case WB Mason $54.63 4/CT NCL NCL183029 

68 Chewing Gum Remover
Simoniz Chewing Gum Remover, 6.5 oz. Aerosol 
Can, 12 Cans/case - S3342012
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

12 per case Conlon $41.98 CASE Simoniz S3342012

70 Air Fresh / Deodorizer
SSS Disinfectant Deodorant - 16.5 oz - 12/case - 
#05003
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

16.5oz - 12 per 
case Conlon $47.00 CASE SSS 21006

71 Disinfectant / Deoderant

NCL Fortress Spray Disinfectant Deodorant - 
1.15OZ Aresol #NCL2004
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]
[Vendor please indicate # of bottles if sold per 
case]

Each WB Mason $52.87 12/CT NCL NCL2004 

73 Bowl Cleaner
Betco Kling Thick Bowl Cleaner - 32oz - MNT-
Wintergreen Scent - #BCC0751200
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

12 per case WB Mason $35.93 12/CT Betco BCC0751200 

74 Bathroom Cleaner
National Chemical Laboratories BATHROOM 
PLUS Non-Acid Disinfectant Bowl & Bathroom 
Cleaner, 32 oz., 12/CS

12 per case WB Mason $22.47 12/CT NCL NCL172045

75 Clorox Wipes 75/container 6 per case Conlon $23.70 CASE FlexWipes 20075
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76 Disinfectant Wipes
Clorox Healthcare Hydrogen Peroxide Wipes - 
155 count - 6/case
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

155 count - 6 per 
case WB Mason $40.62 6/CT Clorox CLO30825

81 #4 Dual Blend Neutral Cleaner NCL-507424 - 4/case
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] 4 per case WB Mason $112.09 4/CT NCL NCL507424 

82 #19 Dual Blend Disinfectant 
Cleaner - Lavender 

NCL-508924 - 4/case
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] 4 per case WB Mason $104.12 4/CT NCL NCL508924 

83 Trash Bags 24”x 32”, 1 ml - 500/case 500 per case Interboro $22.72 500 INT-2432-Med As per sample #83

84 Trash Bags 38" x 58" 2 ply, 2 ml -100/case 100 per case Internboro $19.48 100 INT-3858-XXH As per sample #84

85 Trash Bags 
38x60 - 2ML Trash Liner - Central Poly - 
CP38602M
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

100 per case Central Poly $27.10 Case/100 Central Poly CP38602M

86 Trash Bags 33" x 39" 1.5 ml -100/case 100 per case Interboro $11.98 100 INT-3339-XXH As per sample #86

87 Trash Bags 33" x 40"  16 mic Liner  Natural 250/case 250 per case Interboro $13.34 250 INT-3340-Med As per sample #87

88 Trash Bags 24”x 33”, 8 mic - 1000/case 1000 per case Interboro $16.82 1000 INT-2433-L As per sample #88

89 Trash Bags 40"x48" 16 mic - 250/box 250 per box Interboro $20.72 250 INT-4048-H As per sample #89

90 Trash Bags Heavy Duty 32 gal. 30" x 37" -500/case 500 per case Central Poly $17.40 Case/500 Central Poly CP3037H

93 Trash Bags Heritage Low-Density Repro Can Liner, 60gal, 
2mil, Black, 38 x 58, 100/Carton box/100 Interboro $29.84 100

INT-3858-Super 
Exh 

As per sample #93

94 Scouring Sponges - Green 
Backing Box - 20/box 20 per box Quill $9.59 20/CT Premier Pads 814851

95 Merlin sponge NextGen Merlin eraser sponges SSS46005 30 per box Pyramid $26.70 BX/30 ABCO SCMP001 **ITEM IS 
MELAMINE**

96 Stripping Pads - Black 3M - 3M08275 - 5/case 5 per case Staples $49.00 5/case Essendant MMM08275
Updated 
08-03-23

96 Stripping Pads - Black 3M - 3M08275 - 5/case 5 per case C&C $38.89 CASE 3M 7300 17" 40137700CASE

Will have 
to pay 

shipping 
charges 

with C&C

Updated 
08-03-23

98 Ice Melt- Low Damage Vegetation 50 pounds - bags Each Mansfield $11.68 50# Blank Ind STORM50

99 Ice Melt Purple Flame - 50 lbs. - SSS - CS531
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] Each Conlon $14.00 BAG SSS 61006

100 ice melt Meltco Premium De-Icer, Eco Friendly, 50 lb. Bag 1 50lb bag Conlon $9.97 BAG MELTCO PFI50BG

101 Powder Free Non Latex Gloves 100 pair/box - 10 boxes/case 100 pair per box - 
10 boxes per case Conlon $20.00 CASE SafetyZone GVP9-SIZE-HH

102 Powder Free Non Latex Gloves 100 pair/box - 10 boxes/case Size XXL 100 pair per box - 
10 boxes per case WB Mason $28.10

100 per box
10 box per case

Cleanguard NWLVGPCPFGXL

103 Paper Towels - Natural Boardwalk Hardwound Paper Towels, 
Nonperforated 1-Ply Natural, 800 ft, 6 Rolls/Carton 6 Rolls/case WB Mason $23.92 6/CT Boardwalk BWK6256

104 Paper Towels - Natural Baywest  # 31300 - 6 rolls/800 ft. - NOTCHED 800 foot - 6 rolls per 
case WB Mason $26.47 6/CT Alliance ALICNK800

105 Paper Towels - Natural 8" x 600' roll -2" core - 12/case - NOT NOTCHED 600 foot - 12 rolls 
per case Mansfield $35.98 12 Nittany Paper P-726N

106 Paper Towels 8" x 800 roll - 6/case - NOT NOTCHED 80o foot - 6 rolls per 
case WB Mason $23.92 6/CT Marcal MRCP728N 

107 Paper Towels - White 8" x 800 roll - 6/case - NOT NOTCHED 800 foot - 6 rolls per 
case WB Mason $31.27 6/CT Marcal MRCP708B
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111 Paper Towel Dispenser
Georgia-Pacific Hygienic Push Paddle Paper 
Towel Dispenser - Translucent Smoke - #5338
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

Each Staples $36.04 1
GA PACIFIC 

COMMERCIA
806419

113 Air freshener Febreze Odor-Eliminating Air Freshener, Morning 
& Dew, 8.8 oz Each WB Mason $4.20 Each P&G PGC96256

Updated 
08-03-23

113 Air freshener Febreze Odor-Eliminating Air Freshener, Morning 
& Dew, 8.8 oz Each C&C $34.91

CASE/12
$2.91 for each

SPARTAN 3023 29000157CASE

Will have 
to pay 

shipping 
charges 

with C&C

Updated 
08-03-23

114 Neutral Cleaner
2.5 Gallon Containers
[Vendor please indicate # of bottles if sold per 
case]

Each Nextgen $26.22 4gall/case MS Stetson BLUEJ1
Updated 
08-03-23

117 Degreaser

Kaivac Kalplow - Kaival - KDG
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]
[Vendor please indicate # of bottles if sold per 
case]

Each C&C $115.87 CASE
KAIVAC KPOW 

KAIPOW 
DEGREASER

33320048CASE

Will have 
to pay 

shipping 
charges 

with C&C

No other 
Vendors 

Bid

Updated 
08-03-23

118 SprayBuff compound 1 Gallon container (4 per case) 4 per case C&C $34.45 CASE SIMONIZ CS0725 10126344CASE

Will have 
to pay 

shipping 
charges 

with C&C

Updated 
08-03-23

118 SprayBuff compound 1 Gallon container (4 per case) 4 per case Nextgen $74.66 4/case MD Stetson SuperUn1
Updated 
08-03-23

119 Glass Cleaner 1 Gallon container (4 per case) 4 per case Conlon $15.00 CASE Simoniz B0400004

120 Gum Remover Gum Remover - aresol can - 6 oz 12 per case Pyramid $33.98 CS/12 CANS CHASE 433-4107

121 Dust Mop Treatment Dust Mop Treatment 12 per case Pyramid $35.98 CS/12 CANS CHASE
438-5152 

**ITEM IS 20oz CAN, 
AEROSOL**

122 Mop Blue/White Finish Wet Mops Each Pyramid $63.48

**ITEM IS LARGE 
SIZE, 12 EA/CS, 

FULL CASES 
ONLY**

ABCO LM203LCSNB 

123 Mop Dry Mop Head Looped - 5x24 - each Each Staples $4.75 1
STAPLES BRANDS 

GROUP
24418789

124 Mop Dry Mop Head Looped - 5x36 - each Each Pyramid $71.76
**12 EA/CS, FULL 

CASES ONLY**
ABCO DMTL12536DBL

125 Mop Dry Mop Head Looped - 5x48 - each Each Staples $7.50 1
STAPLES BRANDS 

GROUP
24418765

126 Wet Mop
End Finish Wet Mop Heads - 24oz - Blue - 5" 
Headband - #RLBV0476
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]

Each WB Mason $49.15 Sold 12/CT Abco ABOCLM303BWN24

128 Finish Wet Mop NextGEn Finish wet mop 20 oz  MFLRPLBW-M 12 per box Conlon $66.72 CASE SSS 37050



Page 6 of 6

# Item Description/Specifications UOM Winning Vendor Bid Price Unit of Measure Brand Order #

129 Industrial Web Foot Wet Mop 24 oz - 12/pack 12 per pack Conlon $44.90 CASE/12 SSS 37037
Updated 
08-03-23

130 Gloves - Powder Free Nitrile - M - 100 pack
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] 100 per box Interboro $2.64 100

Sri Trang/Shield 
line-Med-NPFG

As per sample #130

131 Gloves - Powder Free Nitrile  - LG - 100 pack
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] 100 per box Interboro $2.64 100

Sri Trang/Shield 
line-Lrg-NPFG

As per sample #131

132 Gloves - Powder Free Nitrile - XLG - 100 pack
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] 100 per box Interboro $2.64 100

Sri Trang/Shield 
line-XL-NPFG

As per sample #132

135 Plastic Spray Bottles 32oz - plastic spray bottles - each Each Pyramid $0.79 EA IMPACT 5032WG **BOTTLE 
ONLY, NO TRIGGER**

136 Plastic Spray Bottles 32oz - trigger spray bottles - each Each Pyramid $0.78 EA IMPACT 4902 **TRIGGER 
ONLY, NO BOTTLE**

137 Rest Room Cleaner Kaivac Kaiblooey Restroom Cleaner - KBLG
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] Each C&C $136.52 CASE

KAIVAC 
KAIBLOOEY 

SHOWER
10100000CASE

Will have 
to pay 

shipping 
charges 

with C&C

No other 
Vendors 

Bid

Updated 
08-03-23

138 Brute Dolly - Black Rubbermaid - RCP640
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] Each Nextgen $37.18 EACH Rubbermaid RUB2640BLA

139 Lobby Dust Pans Rubbermaid - RCP2531
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] Each Nextgen $10.01 EACH Rubbermaid RUB2531BLA

141 HAND SOAP Alfia - Foaming Hand Soap  - #0431-57
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] Box/6 WB Mason $31.80 6/CT NCL NCL043157
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